FAHRB\SBHB111_018.XM

L

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 3854, AS REPORTED

OFFERED BY MS. CLARKE OF NEW YORK

Page 134, after line 14, insert the following (and re-

designate succeeding sections accordingly):

1 SEC.

2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

fAVHLC\102609\102609.499.xmi
October 26, 2009 (11:14 p.m.)

309. INCREASED LOAN LIMITS.

Section 7(m) _of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C.

636(m)), as amended by fhis Act, is further amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)(B)@iil)) by striking
“$35,000” and inserting “$50,000”;

(2) in paragraph (3)(E) by striking “$35,000”
each place it appears and inserting “$50,000”’; and

(3)-in parégraph (11)(B) by striking V“$35,OOO”
and inserting “$50,000”.

(45338011)

20b





