| . AN AMENDMENT TO BE OFFERED BY REPRESENTATIVE

_Gevree Meerk OF (ALWTFoeNEA
OR HTS DESIGNEE, DEBATABLE FOR SO MINUTES.




FABINTHE&LANCSAMGR 005 XML

AMENTMENT TO H.R. 1388, AS REPORTED

OFFERED BY MR. GEORGE MILLER OF

CALIFORNIA

In the table of contents in section 1(b) of the bill,
strike the item relating to title VI and the items relating
~ to.sections 6101 through 6109.

In section 3 of the National and Community Service
Act of 1990 (as prOpbsed to be inserted by section 1101
of the bill), strike “the programs authorized. under sub-

title C”’ and insert “approved national service positions’’.

In section 101(12) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be inserted by sec-
tion 1102(6) of the bill), strike “ORGANIZATION” and in-

'sert.- “ENTITY” in the heading.

In section 101(12) of the National and Community
Sexjvicé Act of 1990 (as proposed  to be inserted by sec-
tion 1102(6) of the bill), in the matter preceding sub-

paragréph (A), strike “organization’” and insert “entity’’.

In section 1102 of the bill, redesignate paragraph
(11) as paragraph (12) and insert after paragraph (10)
the following: | |

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABJY\111E&L\NCSAWMGR_005. XML

2

2
(11) in paragraph (33) (as so redes_ignated),

strike the last sentence.

In the matter proposed to be added by section -

1102(12) _of the bill (as redesignated by the breéedjhg

amendment), redesignate paragraphs (38) through (40)

as paragraphs (41) through (43), respectively, and insert

after paragraph (37) the following:

3 "‘(38) SCIENTIFICALLY VALID RESEARCH.—TLe
4 - term ‘scientifically valid research’ includes applied-
5 research, basic research,- and ﬁeld-initiafed research
6 in _Which the rationale, design,_ and interpretation are
7 §Qundiy Aeveloped in accordance with principles of
8 scientific research.
9 | ' “(39) PRINCIPLES IF SCIENTIFIC BESEARCH.-'—
\ 10 The term ‘principles of ecientiﬁc research’ r_xieen_s
11 principl'es of feseareh that—
12 - “(A) applies rigorous, systematic, and ob-
13 jective methodoiogy to obtain reliable and valid
.14 knowledge relevant to education activities and
15 prog"réms; - |
16 “(B) presen’ts ﬁndings and makes. claims
17 that are appropriate to and supported by meth- o
18 ods. 'that'hax.re been employed; and | |
19 “(C) includes, as appropriate to the re-
20 search being conducted—
FAVHLCI0317090031709.036.xi e

March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABIY\111E&L\NCSA\WMGR_005.XML

3

1 “(I) use of systematic, empirical

2 methods thét draw on observation or ex--

3 periment;

4 “(i1) use of data analyses that are

5 adequate to support the general findings;

6 “(ii1) reliance on measurements or ob-

7 servational methods that provide reliable

8 and generalizablerﬁndjngs;

9 “(iv) strong claims of causal relation-
10 ships, only with research designs that
1n ‘eliminate plausible competing .explanations_
1-2 - for observed 'fesults, such. as, but not lim-
13 ited td, random assignment experiments; |
14 ‘.‘(V) presentation of studies and meth-
15 éds in sufficient detail and clarity to allow
16 for replication or, af a minimum, to offer
17 the opportunity to build systematically on
18 the findings of the research; | |
19 | ‘-‘(_vi)" acceptance by a peer-revievs-(é.d
20 journal or critique by a panel of. inde-
21 - pendent experts through a comparably rig-
22 6rbus, objective, and scientific review; and
23 “(vil) eonsistency of ﬁnaings aeross .
24 multiple studies- or sites to support the
25 generality of results and conclusions. |

f:\VHLC\031705\031709.035.me (42758913)

March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABJY\111E&L\NCSAWMGR_005. XML

4
1 “(40) SEVERELY ECONOMICALLY DISTRESSED
2 COMMUNITY.—The term ‘severely economically dis-
3 tressed community’ means an area that has' a mort-
4 gage foreclosure rate, home price decline, and unem-
5 ployment rate greater than the national mortgage
6 foreclosure rate, home price dechine, and unemploy-
7 | ment rate for the last 12 months for which satisfac-
8 tory data are available, or a residential area that
9 lacks basic living - necessities, such as water and -
10 sewer systems, electricity, paved roads, and safe san-
11

itary housing.”.

In- section 101(42) (as so redesignatéd) of the Na- |
tional and Coinlﬁunity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed
to be émended by section 1102(12) (as so redesignated)
of the bill), strike “means any individual’”’ and all that
followé through “condition other than dishonorable” and
insert “‘has the meanjng-gi{ren the term in section 101 of

title 38, United States Code.”

In section 111(a)(2) of the National and Community
Service 'Ac't of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “training”’ and insert “pro-

fessional development”.
 In section 111(b)(1)(A) of the National and Com-

- munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended

- fAVHLC\031709\031 709.0357xml (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABJ\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005.XML
5
by section 1201 of the bill), strike “training” and insert

“professional development’.

In section 111(b)(3)(B) of the National and Com-
munity Serviee Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended
by section 1201 of the bill), strike “training” and insert

“professional development’.

In section 111(b)(5)(B) of the National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as pro'poséd to be amended
-by section 1201 of the bill), strike “‘promote a better un- |

dei‘standjng of”’.

In seection 111(b)(5)(C) of the National and Commu-
nity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by
section 1201 of the bill), strike “promote a better under-

standing of”.

-In section 111(e) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), in the matter preceding paragraph

(1), strike “The” and insert “Fi'om the amounts appro-

priated under section 501(a)(4), the”.

In sec‘tion' 111(d)(i) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “training” and insert “pro-

' fessional development”.

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml ' (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABIY\I11E&L\NCSA\MGR_005.XML
. 6
In section 111(d)(2) of the National and Community

Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “and” at the end.

In section 111(d)(3) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike the period at the end and

insert ‘; and”’.

In section 111(d) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (—as proposed to be amended by sec-
‘tion 1201 of the bill), insert at the end the following: = -

1 ‘.‘(4)‘assistin'g. schools and school districts in de-
2 veloping school policies and practices that support
3  the infegra_tibn of service-learning into the cur- _
4 riculum.”. |

In section 112(e) -of the National and Community
Service Act of 199_0 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “‘community-baséd org\aniza-
tion”” and insert ‘éeommunjty-based entity’”’, and strike
“community-based orgénizations” and insert “commu-

"nity-based entities”. .

In section 112(d) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by..sec—
tion 1201 of thé‘ bill), strike “this .p-art” and insert “this
subtitle”. |

f:\VHLC\031i09\091 709.035.xml (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



- FABJIY\I 11E&L\NCSA\MGR_005. XML
_ . | 7
In section 112(d) of the National and Community

Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “$65,000” and insert
1$75,000”.

In section 113(b)(1) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “service” and insert “serv-

ice-learning’’.

In section 113(e)(1) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amendéd by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), in the matter fpoWing subparé—
graph (E), strike ‘‘community-based organization” and:

insert ‘‘community-based entity”’.

In section 113(c)(1) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), insert “and” at the end of sub-

. paragraph (C)..

In section 113(c)(1) of the National and Commﬁnity
Service Act of 19_90 (as proposed to be amended by see-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “and” at the end of sub-

paragraph (D).

' In section 113(c)(1) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike paragraph (E). |

t:\VHLC\osi709\_031709.035;xm1 (42758913)
“March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABJY\111EZL\NCSA\MGR_005.XML
‘ 8
In section 115(a)(2) of the National and Community

- Service Act of 1990 (as proposéd to be amended by sec-
tion 1201 of the bill), strike “training” and insert “pro-

fessional development”.

In section 116(b)(2)(B) of the National and Com-
munity Service: Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended
by section 1201 of the bill), strike ‘“‘purposes consiétent
with title T of such Act (20 U.S.C. 6301 et seq.)” and
insert ‘“‘activities authorized undér section 1114 or 1115
of title I of such Act (as appli_cable) subject to the ap-

proval of the local educatioﬁal_agency’.

 Strike clause (iii) of section 1301(2)(B) of the bill,

and insert the following:

1 (ii1) by striking “by the agency.” and

2 inserting “by the agency, and may approve
3 national service p‘osiﬁons for a program
4 carried out or otherwise supported by ‘the
5 agency.” |

In secﬁon 122(&)(1)(A) of the National and Commu? '
nity ‘Service Act bf 1990 (as’proposed to be amended by
section 1302 of the bill), strike clause (i1) and redesig-
nate clauses (1) through (xiv) as: élauses- (1) th_ro_ugh

~ (xdii), respectively.

f:\VHLC\031 709\031709.035.xml (42758913)
" March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)-



F:\BJY\111E&L\NCSAWMGR_005.XML
9
In section 122(a)(2)(A)(vi) of the National and

Community Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be
amended by section 1302 of the bill), insert before the
semicolon “including the recruitment of youth to work in

health professions in such communities”.

In section 1_22(a)(3)(A)(xi) of the National and
Community Service Act of 1990 (as pfoposed to .bé
amended by section 1302 of the bi]l), in the mafter pre-
ceding subclause (I), strike “(including youth corps pro-
grams” and all that .fo']lows through “Hawaiian home

lands),”.

In section 122(a)(3)(A)(x1)(II) of the National and |
Cdm'mum'ty Service Aet of 1990 (as 'pfop_osed to be
" amended by section _1302 of the bill), strike “youths who
are individuals with disabilities and'youthé who are eco-
nomically disadvantaged” and insertl “and youths who are
individuals with disabilities”. |

In section 122(a)(3)(A)(xii) of the National and
.Community_ Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be
amended by section 1302 of ‘the bill), insert “‘in partner-

~ ship with the National Park Service” after “projects”.

In section 122(a) of the National and Community

Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by -sec-
tion 1302 of the bill), insert at the end the following:

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml - (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.) )



FABJY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005. XML

J—t

O 00 N N Ut B W

-b-w_m»—no,\ooo\)mux-b-_uw»—no

25

10

~ “(5) PROGRAM MODELS FOR SERVICE CORPS.—
In addition to any activities described in paragraphs
(1).th'rough (4), a recipient of a grant under section.
121(a) and a Federal agency operating or sup-
porting a national service program under section
121(b) may directly or through grants or subgrants
to other entities carry. out a national service corps
through the following program models:
“(A) a community corps program that -
~meets unmet human, eduecational, heath, fret—
eran, enﬁromnental, or public ;safety needs ar_id
promotes greater community unity through the?
use of orgé'nized teams of participants of varied
social and economic backgrounds, skill 1evels,
physical and -deVelopme'ntal capabi’liti.es,. agés',
ethnic backgrounds, or genders;
“(B) a service program that—

“@) recruits individuals with special
~skills - or provides specialized preservice
training to enable participants to be placed
individually or in teams in positions m
which the participants can meet such
unmet needs; and
| “() if éonsist_ehf with the purposes of

“the program, brings participants together

l £A\VHLC\031709\031709.035.xml - (42758913)

March 1_7, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



F:\BJY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005.XML

11
1 for additional training and other activities
2 designed to foster civie responsibility, in-
3 crease the skills of participants, and im-
4 prove the quality of the service provided;
5 “(C) a campus based program that is de-
6 signed to provide substantial service in a com-
7 munity during the school term afld during sum-
8 mer or other vacation periods through the use
9 of——. |
10 | “(1) students who are attending an in-
11 stitution of higher education, including
12 students participating 111 a work sfudy pro-
13 gram assisted under part C of title IV of
14 the Higher Education Act of 1965 (42
15 U.8.C. 2751 et seq.);
16 | “(ii) teams composed of such stu-
17 dents; orr
18 “(iil) teams composed of a combina-
19 tion of such students and communitj resi-
20 _dents;
21 “(D) a professional corps program that re-
22 cruits and places qualified participants in posi-
23 tions— |
24 “(1) as teachers, nufses and othér
25, : health care providers, po]icé officers, early
FVHLC\031709\031700.036xml  (42756913)

March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABIM\I11IE&L\NCSAWMGR _005.XML

ju—

O &0 N O W B W N

[y I N e e e T o T e Y~ SV Gy Sy

- In section

sion,

12
childhood development staff, engineers, or
other professionals providing service to
meet educational, human, .environmental,
or public safety needs in communities with
an inadequate number of such profes-
sionals;

“(i1) that may include a salary_'in ex-
cess of the maxiinum living allowance au-
thorized in subséctioﬁ (a)(3) of section
140, as pro‘vi'ded-in subsection (e) o.f such
section; and | _ _

- “(ii1) that are sponsored by public or
prifrate employers who a,gree to pay 100
percent of the salaries and benefits (other
than any national service educational
award under subﬁtle D) of the partici-
pants; and

“(E) such other program models as ap-

proved by' the Corporation or a State commis-

as appropriate.”.

122(a)(3)(A)(>;i) of the National and

Community Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be

‘amended by section 1302 of the bill), in subclause 'II.,

strike “ai_ld at least 50 percent of whom are” and insert

“including”.

-~ fAVHLC\031709\031703.035.xml (42758913)

March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABIY\]1 1E&L\NCSA\MGR_005 XML
13
In section 122(b)(1)(D) of the National and Com-

munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended
by section 1302 of the bill), in the matter preceding

clause (1), insert ‘“‘and improve nutrition” after ‘hunger”.

In section 122(b)(1)(D) of the National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended
by section 1302 of the bill), insert “faith-based entities”
after “food pantries” both places it appears in clauses (i)

and (ii), respectively.

In section 122(b)(1)(D) of the National and Com-
munity Sérvice_Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended
by Séétion 1302 of thé bill), rédesignate élauses (iil) and
(iv) as clauses (v) and (Vi), respectif/ely, and after clause

(i1) insert the following:

1 ~ “(iii) increasing access to and partici-

2 pation in federally supported nutrition pro- .
3 grams; |

4 “(ix_z) involving the preparation and’
5 delivery of 'nutﬂtibus food and the dissemi-

6 nation of nutrition education- to critically -

7 and chronically ill individuals;”.

In sectlon 122(b)(1) of the National and Community
Semce Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by see- -
tion 1302 of the bill), redésignate subparagraph (J) as

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xm} " (42758913)
-March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.}



FABIV\111E&LANCSAMGR_005.XML

14

subparagraph (R) and insert after subparagraph (I) the

following: -

Pa—

O 0 1 O W A W N

N = © 0 0 N o0 L B W N = O

23

fA\VHLC\031709\031709.035.xml
March 17, 2008 (10:18 a.m.)

“dJ) Providing financial literacy education
to economically disadvantaged individuals, in-
cluding financial literacy eduecation with regard
to credit management, financial institutions n-
cluaing banks and credit unions, and utilization
of savings plans.

“(K) Assisting in building, improving, and

preserving affordable housing and in the con-

~struction and rehabilitation of housing units, in-

cluding ehergy efﬁcient homes, for ecor_lomica]_ly
disadvantaged individuals.

“(L) Assisting individuals in obtaining ac-

“cess to healt'h.care for themselves or their chil-

dren.
- “(M) Assisting individuals in obtaining in-

formation about Federal, State, local, or private

programs or benefits focused on assisting eco-

" nomically disadvantaged individuals, economi-

cally disadvantaged children, or low-income |

- famihes.

“(Nj Facilitating enrollment in ,aiui com-
pletion of job training for economically dis-

advantaged individuals.

(42758913)



FABIT\1 1 1IE&L\NCSAWMGR_005.XML

O ® N A U AW N -

O s T = Y S S
A W= O

15
! “(0) Assisting economically disadvantaged

' individuals in obtaining access to job placement

assistance.
“(P) Promoting commﬁnity-based efforts
to reduce crime and recruiting public safety of-

ficers into service opportunities to work with

: disadvantaged youth.

“(Q) A musician and artist corps program
that trains and deploys skilled musicians aﬁd
artists to promote greater community unity
through the use of music and arts education
and ehgagement through work in low income
communit’ies, education,- healthcare and thera-
peutic settings, and other work in the public do-

main with citizens of all ages.”.

Ih section_126(a)(3)(B) of the National and Com-

munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended

by section 1305 of the bill), strike “$200,000” and insert

“$250,000”, and insert before the period “in excess of
© $100,0007.

In section 126(a)(3)(C) of the National and Commu--

| nity.Serv.ice Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by-

section 1305 of the bill), strike “$200,000” in the heading

and insert “$250,000”, and insert before the period “in ex-

cess of $250,000”.

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xm!
March 17, 2008 (10:18 a.m.) -

(42758913)



FABIY\I11E&L\NCSA\MGR_005. XML
16
In section 126(3)(3)(C) of the National and Commu-
nity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by
section 1305 of the bill), strike “$200,000” and insert
“$250,000”, and insert before the period “in excess of
$250,000”". |

Strike subparagraph (D) of section 126(a)(3) of the
National and Community Service Act of 1990 (as pro-
posed to be inserted by section 1305(1)(B) of thébi]l),

~ and insert the fo]lowing:'

“(4) RESERVATION OF FUNDS.—From the

—

amounﬁs ap_propriat\ed_ to carry out this subsection
each fiscal year, the éorporatidn sha]l- ensure that it
reserves funds for .as.sistance provided under this
subsection at an aggregate amount equal to that of .
ait- least 150 percent allocated in fiscal year 2004 for
the first full ﬁscal year after the date of enactment

of the GIVE Act. Each subsequent year the corpora-

O 0 N N AW N

tion shall increase the amount reserved proportion-

Sy
o

ately including minimum and maximum amounts de-

—
—

seribed in paragraph (1) to the amount of program

Sy
N

funding allocated in subtitle C.”.

In section 129(b) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (és proposed to be a,mendéd by see- |
tion 1306 of the bill), in the matter preceding paragraph

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml (42758913)
‘March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



F\BJY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005.XML

17
(1), strike ¢, including nonprofit organizations applying
on behalf of a tribe or tribes” and strike “In the case of

a”’ and all that follows through “its application—"".

In section 129(b) of the- National and Community'
Service Act of 1990 (as prdposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1306 of the bil_l), strike paragraphs (1) and (2).

In section 129(f)(1) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as pfoposed to be amended by see--
tion 1306 of the bill), strike “organizations” and insert
“entities”.

In section 1308 of the .bi]l, strike paragraph (7) and

insert the following:

(7) by amending subsection (h) (as so redesig- '
riated) to read as follows:

“(h) LIMITATION ON SAME PROJECT RECEIVING
MULTIPLE GRANTS.—Unless specifically authorized by
law, the Corporafion may not prbvide mo‘ré than 1 g'rant -
under the national service laws to support the same

project.”.

‘In section 133(e)(6)(F") of the National and Commu-

nity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by
- section 1310(1) of the bill), insert ‘“or home price de-
cline’” after each place “mortgage foreclosure rate” ap-

pears.

(:\VHLC\031_709\031 709.035.xml (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 am) -



FABIY\11 IE&L\NCSA\MGk_oos.mL
18
In section 1303 of the bill, amend paragraph (2) to

read as follows:

1 (2) in paragraph (5),

2 (A) by inserting “National” before “Civil-
3 | ian Cominunity Corps’’; and

4 (B) byr inserting before the period ‘“the
-57 Summer of Service program under -section
6 120(c)(8), the ServeAmerica Fellowship under
7 198B or the Silver Scholarship '_under. section
8 | 198C(a)”. .

In section 129(j) of the National and Community

Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amehded by sec-

 tion 1306 of the ‘biﬂ), stﬁke “section 126” and insert
“section 126(b) and (c)”. | |

~In section 129A(c) of the National and Community

" Service Act of 1990 (as proposed. to bé inserted by sec-
tion 1307 of the bill), strike “2008” and insert ‘f2009;’.'
In section 1310 of the bill, amehd pafagraph (3) to

read as follows:

9 , (3.) in subsection (d), by adding at the end the
10 following: |
1m “(5) DIVERSITY IN PROGRAM SIZE.—The Cor-
12 . poration shall ehsure that recipients- of assistance
13 provided ﬁnder_ sectioﬁ 121 are diverse in terms of

f:\VHLC\D31709\031709.035.me (42758913)
March 17,2009 (10:18 a.m.) .



F:ABJY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005. XML
19
1 program size, as reflected in the number of partici-

2 pants.”.

In paragraph (1) of the matter proposed to be in-
serted by section 1402(3) of the bill insert “,. including
in the Summer of Service program under section
120(e)(8), the ServeAmerica program under Seetior_l
198B, or the Silver Scholarship program under section
198E” after ‘‘position”.

In section 149(a)(1) (_)f the National and 'Corhmunity
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by section
1405’ of the, bill), in the matter preceding subparagraph-
(A), strike “subtitle C and D and insert “subtitles C,
D, and H”. .

In section 149(a)(4)(A) of the National and Commu-
nity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by sec-
tion 1405 of the bill), strike “2009” and insert “2010”.

In section 149(b)(1)(A) of the National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by
section 1405 of the _bill), si_:rike “C and D.” and insert “C,
D, and H”.- |

In section 149(b)(1)(B)(i) of the National and Com-
’ -munity Service Act of 1990 (aé propdsed. to be addéd by
_section 1405 of the bill), strike “2009” and insert

“2010” each place such term appears.

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xm! (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



F:ABIY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005.XML
' 20
In section 149(b)(1)(B)(i) of the National and Com-

munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by
section 1405 of the bill), strike “D, or E” and insert “D,
E, or H”.

In section 149(b)(i)(B)(i) of the National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as propdsed to be added by
section 1405 of the bill), strike “or”’ before ‘‘summer”
and insert ““, Silver Scholarship under section 198C, or
ServeAmerica Fellowship under section 198B” after “sec-

tion 120(c)(8),”.

In section 149(b)(1)(B)(ii) of the National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be édded by
section 1405 of the bill), strike “2009” and insert
“2010”.

_ In section 149(b)(1)(B)(11) of the National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed' to be added by
section 1405 of the bill), strike “or E” and insert “E, or
H77. -

In section 149(b)(1)(B)(ii) of the National and Com-
munity Serviee Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by |
sgcti_on 1405 of the bill), striker “or” béfore “suinmer’-’
and insert , Silver Schoiarship under section .198('3, or
ServeAxﬁerica Fellowship under section 198B” after “sec-

tion 120(c)(8),”.

AVHLC\031709\031709.035.xm! (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABIY\IL 1E&L\NCSAMGR_005. XML
21
In section 1503(4) of the bill, strike “subsection (e)”

and insert ‘“subsection (d)”.

In section 155(b)(4) of the_N ational and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1505 of the bill), in the matter preceding subpara-

graph (A), strike ‘“‘from Corps members”.

In section 155(b)(4)(C) of fhe National and Commu-
nity :Serﬁce'Aét of .1990 .(as proposed to be amended by
section 1505 of the  bill), strike “limitation on the
amount”’ and all that follows through “established
under” and insert “Director may establish a separate liv-

ing allowance amount consistent with the limitation in”.

In section 1503(3)(B) of the bill, in the matter pro-
posed to be amended by such section, strike “2011” and
insert “2012”.

In section 178(e){(1)(G) of the National and Commu- -
nity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be ainended by
section 1605(3) of the bill), strike “and” at the end.

I'n‘ section 178(e)(1)(H) of the ‘National and Com-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as p'roposed to be amended .
" by section 1605(3) of the bill), strike the period at the

end and insert ¢; and”.

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml (42758913)
March 17,2009 (10:18 a.m.) -



FABIY\1 11E&LANCSAMGR_ 005. XML
22
In section 1605(3) of the bill, strike the close

quotation mark and following semicolon after the matter
- proposed to be inserted by such section and at the end

of such section insert the following:

1 o “(I) ensures outreach to and coordination
2 with municipalities and county governments, in-
3 cluding large cities.”;

In section. i78(g')(1) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1605(5) of the bill), strike “B or”.

Tn subsection (m) of section 179 of thé National and . _.
Community Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to.be added
by section 1606 of the bill), strike pardgraph (4) aﬁd re-
desighate paragraphs (5) and (6} as paragraphs (4) and
(5), resp;actively. | o

" Insert after section 189 of the Natibna.l and- Com—'
mumty Servieq Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by
section 1610 .of the bill) the following:

4 “SEC. 189A. RESTRICTIONS ON FEDERAL GOVERNMENT
5 AND USE oF FEDERAL FUNDS. | |

6 “(a) GENERAL PrROHIBITION.—Nothing in 'thjs. Act
7 shall be constraed to authorize an officer or empldyee of
8 the Federal Government to mandate, difect, or control a- '

9 State, local educational agency, or school’s curriculum,

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



F:ABJY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005. XML

23

anck

program of instruction, specific instructional content, aca-
demic achievement standards, assessments, or allocation
of Sfate or local resources, or mandate a State or any sub-
division thereof to spend any funds or incur any costs not
paid for under this Act.

“(b) PROHIBITION ON ENDORSEMENT OF CUR-
RICULUM.—No funds provided to the Chief Executive Of-

ﬁcer under this Act may be used by the Corporation to

O 0 NN O W AW \]

endorse, approve, or sanction any curriculum designed to

be used in an elementary school or secondary school.

[ w—y
- O

“(c) PROHIBITION ON REQUIRING FEDERAL AP-

[a—y
R

PROVAL OR CERTIFICATION STANDARDS.—No State shall

oy
(98]

be required to have academic content or student academic

[a—y
A-D-

achievement standards approved or certified by the Fed-

eral Government, in order to receive assistance under this .

—
A L

Act.”.

In paragraph (12)(G) of section 193A of the Na- -
- tional and Community Service Act of 1990 as propose_.d'
to be added by section 1704 of the bill, insert “cultural

institutions,” after “disabilities,”’

In section 17 04:(1)(D) of the bill, strike parag'raph
(21) of the matter propbsed lto be added by such secfion
and redesignate subparagraphs’ (22) through (24) as sub-
paragraphs (21) through (23), respectlvely

’ f:WH LC\031709\031709.035.xml (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABIY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR_005.XML
24

In the matter proposed to be inserted by section
1704(3)(B) of the bill, redesignate paragraphs (4)
through (6) as paragraphs (5) through (7) and insert
after paragraph (3) the following:

1 “(4) CONSOLIDATED APPLICATION.—To pro-
2 mote efficiency and eliminate duplicative require-
3 ments, the Corporation shall coriso]jdate or modify
4 application 'procedures ‘and reporting requirements
5 for programs and activities funded under the na-
6 tional service laws.”.

In section 1705 of the bill, add at the end the fol-
lowing: “In carrying out this section and before lex_ecuti.ng
any" delegéﬁion of authority, the Chief Executive Officer
shall seek input from and consult with Corporatioh em-
ployees, State commissions 6n national and community
sei'vice, State educational agencigs,- and other interested

stakeholders.”

In sectioﬁ _1980(5) of the Nation_al and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed t§ be added by section
1805-of the bill), strike ‘“‘community-based organization”

_ énd. insert “community-based entity” each place such
term appears. |

In éeétion 194_((3)(1) of the National and Commumty
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-

f:\VHLC\031709\031709.035.xm| (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.} 0



FABIY\111E&L\WNCSA\MGR_005.XML

25
tion 1706 of the bill), strike ‘“‘subject to the provisions of

title 5, United States Code” and all that follows through

‘“‘pay rates” and insert “pursuant to sections 195(a) and

195(b) of this Aect”. .

In section 198B(d)(1)(A) of the National and Cor-
munity Service Act of 1990 (as prbposed to be added by
section 1803 of the bill), strike “or an institution of high-

er education that is not a Campus of Service (as de-

seribed in section 119)”,

| '_In section 198C(a)(6) of the National and Commu-

nity Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by see-
tion 1803 of the bill), strike “ﬁXed-amount”; |

In section 198D(a) of the National aﬁd Com;nunity

Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by section

1804 of the bill)‘, amend paragraph (5) to read as follows:

1

O 0 N N R W

“(5) PROGRAMS THAT SUPPORT MENTORING.—
Prbgrams to support mentoring partnerships, includ-
ing Sta_teWide and local partnérships that strengthen

direct-service yoilt_h mentdring programs by increas-

_ ing State resources dedicated to"mentorilig, assisting

- direct-service mentoring prbgrams through sub-

grants,- prorhoting quality standards for mentoring

progfams, expanding mentoring opportunities tai-

lored to the needs and circumstances of youth, and

| H\VHLC\031709\031709.035.xml  (42758913)

. March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



FABJY\111E&L\NCSAMGR_005.XML
26

1 increasing the number of at-risk youth in the State
receiving mentoring from \screened and trained adult
mentors, as well as programs to support the creation
of stétewide mentoring partnerships and programs
of national scope throﬁgh' collaborative efforts be-

tween entities such as local mentoring partnerships,

units of State or local government, or direct service

0 N A L A WN

mentoring programs.’’.

| Tn section 198D(a) of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by section
1804 of the bill), strike paragraph (6) and redesignate

paragraph (7) as _paragraph'.(6). u

In section 198E of the National and Community
Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be added by section
1805 -of the bill), strike subsectibn (e) and redesignate
subsections (d)_ through (1) as subsections (é) .through _
(k), respectively. - |

In éection 501(a)__(2)(B-) of fhé Naﬁonal and Com- -
munity Serviece Act of 19907 (as ‘proposed .to be amended
by section 1841 of the bill), strike “subparagraph (C)”
| ahd insert “subparégraph (A)”, and insert before the pe-
‘tiod at the end the following: “, and disasters of similar

magnitude”..

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml (42758913) : ' L
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.) :



F:\BJY\111E&L\NCSA\MGR _005. XML
27
In section 501(a)(3) of the National and Community

Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be amended by sec-
tion 1841 of the bill), strike “$35,000,000” and insert
%$30,000,000.

In section 2103(3) of the bill, insert “and” at the
end of subparagraph (A), strike “and” at the end of sub-
paragraph (B), and strike subparagraph (C).

In section 201 (e)(1) of the Domestic Volunteer Serv-
ice Act of 1973 (as proposed to be aménded by section
2203 of the bill), strike “2013” and insert “2014”.

In section 225(a)(4) of the Doméstic Volunteers
Service Act of 1973 .(as propose to be amended by section
2208 of the bill), strike “grants” the first place it- ap-
pears and insert “funds”, and strike “grant§” the last

place it appears and insert ‘“‘funds available”.

Tn the table of contents of the of the National and
Community Service Act of 1990 (as proposed to be
amended by section 4101 of the bill), after the item relat-

ing to section 189, insert the following:
~ “Sec. -189A. Restrictions on Federal Govern-ment and use of Federal funds.”.
Strike title VI of the bill.

fAVHLC\031709\031709.035.xml  ~  (42758913)
March 17, 2009 (10:18 a.m.)



