FAGMK\NDA12\MTR_001.XML
[HR 1540]

MoTION TO RECOMMIT WITH INSTRUCTIONS

moves to recommit the

bill H.R. 1540 to the Committee on Armed Services with

instructions to report the same back to the House forth-

with with the following amendment:

At the end of subtitle B of title VI, add the fol-

lowing new section:

O o0 9 N U B WD =

—_ = =
W o = O

SEC. 617. INCREASE IN MAXIMUM AMOUNT OF SPECIAL PAY
FOR DUTY SUBJECT TO HOSTILE FIRE OR IM-
MINENT DANGER.

(a) HosTILE FIRE OR IMMINENT DANGER PAY
UNDER EXISTING SPECIAL PAY AUTHORITY.—Section
310(b)(1) of title 37, United States Code, is amended by
striking “$225 a month” and inserting “$325 a month”.

(b) IMMINENT DANGER PAY UNDER CONSOLIDATED

SPECIAL PAY AUTHORITIES.—Section 351(b)(3) of such
title is amended by striking “$250 per month” and insert-

ing “$325 per month”.

(¢) APPLICATION OF AMENDMENTS.—The amend-

ments made by this section shall take effect on October

fA\VHLC\052511\052511.168.xml (49840011)
May 25, 2011 (4:56 p.m.)



FAGMK\NDA12\MTR_001.XML
[HR 1540]
2

I 1, 2011, and apply with respect to months beginning on

2 or after that date.

fA\VHLC\052511\052511.168.xml (49840011)
May 25, 2011 (4:56 p.m.)



